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Faculty
Derek C. Abbott is a partner with Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP in Wilmington, Del., and 
a member of its Business Reorganization & Restructuring Group. He also chairs the firm’s pro bono 
committee and sits on the firm’s recruiting committee Mr. Abbott has represented Fortune 1000, 
local, international and other organizations as lead or Delaware counsel in bankruptcy proceedings 
and litigation on behalf of debtors, creditors, official and ad hoc committees and transactional case 
constituents. He regularly works with debtors in possession and exit-financing lenders, as well as 
outside and inside counsel, turnaround professionals, crisis-management firms, and investment and 
non-investment bank professionals. Mr. Abbott also frequently serves as a mediator in matters related 
to insolvency and distressed businesses, including both adversary proceedings and case-dispositive 
matters. In addition, he has served as an expert witness in matters involving restructuring and bank-
ruptcy matters both domestically and internationally. Mr. Abbott’s recent client representations in-
clude AT&T Inc., General Motors Corp., Quality Care Properties, Philips International, Viacom Inc., 
TD Bank and Nortel Networks. He has been recognized by Chambers USA, The Best Lawyers in 
America, Law & Politics magazine and Delaware Super Lawyers. In 2016, he was invited to join the 
28th Class of Fellows of the American College of Bankruptcy, and in 2018, he was presented with 
the Delaware State Bar Association’s Access to Justice Commitment Award, which recognized his 
commitment to pro bono work throughout his career. In 2011, he received the Caleb R. Layton III 
Service Award, presented by the judges of the U.S. District and Bankruptcy Courts for the District of 
Delaware. Mr. Abbott is a member of the American and Delaware State Bar Associations, Turnaround 
Management Association and ABI, and is a frequent speaker. He also serves as legal counsel for a 
variety of indigent clients through Delaware Volunteer Legal Services. Mr. Abbott received his B.S. 
in human factors psychology in 1987 from the U.S. Military Academy at West Point and his J.D. with 
honors from the University of North Carolina School of Law in 1995, where he was an editor of the 
North Carolina Law Review.

Jennifer A. Christian is a partner at ASK LLP in New York, and her practice focuses on represent-
ing indenture trustees, secured and unsecured creditors (including trade creditors), asset-purchasers, 
liquidating trustees, and other major constituencies in chapter 11 and chapter 7 bankruptcy cases and 
other proceedings. She has more than 15 years of bankruptcy and creditors’ rights experience. Prior to 
joining ASK LLP, Ms. Christian was counsel at Thompson & Knight LLP and an associate at Kelley, 
Drye & Warren LLP and Bryan Cave LLP. Prior to entering private practice, she clerked for two years 
for the Chief Judge of the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the Western District of New York in Rochester. 
Ms. Christian is admitted to practice law in New York and Connecticut, and before the U.S. District 
Courts for the Southern, Eastern and Western Districts of New York. She received her B.A. in po-
litical science from the State University of New York – College at Geneseo and interned at both the 
Monroe County District Attorneys’ Office and the White House, where she worked in the Office of 
the Legal Counsel to the Vice President of the United States. She received her J.D. from St. John’s 
University School of Law in 2000 with honors and participated in its first-ever Bankruptcy LL.M. 
program, and she won the Springer Legislative Award for Excellence in Legislative Advocacy and 
the CALI Excellence for the Future Scholastic Awards in Trusts & Estates and Legislative Advocacy. 
She interned for Hon. James L. Garrity, Jr. of the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of 
New York.
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Laura Davis Jones is a named partner and management committee member of Pachulski Stang Ziehl 
& Jones LLP in Wilmington, Del., and is the managing partner of the firm’s Delaware office. She 
gained national recognition as debtor’s counsel in the Continental Airlines bankruptcy case and has 
represented numerous debtors, creditors’ committees, bank groups, acquirers and other significant 
constituencies in national chapter 11 cases and workout proceedings. Ms. Jones participates as a 
speaker at national bankruptcy and litigation seminars, and she has authored numerous articles. She 
was named “Deal Maker of the Year” by The American Lawyer in 2002, which also has profiled her. 
Ms. Jones has been named continuously by her peers as one of the The Best Lawyers in America” 
and as one of the “Best Lawyers in Delaware,” and was selected as one of the top 10 lawyers in 
Delaware by Delaware Super Lawyers. She is a Fellow of the American College of Bankruptcy and 
a Chambers USA “Star Individual,” the highest honor a lawyer can receive. Ms. Jones has been rec-
ognized in the K&A Restructuring Register and the Lawdragon 500 since their inception, has been 
named repeatedly to the International Who’s Who of Insolvency and Restructuring Lawyers, and is 
AV-rated by Martindale-Hubbell. In 2018, she received the prestigious “Women Leadership” award 
at Global M&A Network’s Turnaround Atlas Awards, which honors the achievement of influential 
women leaders in the restructuring and turnaround communities. She started her career as a judicial 
law clerk in the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware. Ms. Jones is admitted to practice 
in Delaware and the District of Columbia. She received her undergraduate degree from the University 
of Delaware and her J.D. from Dickinson School of Law, where she was on the board of editors and 
business manager for the Dickinson Law Review and served on the Appellate Moot Court Board.

Hon. J. Kate Stickles is a U.S. Bankruptcy Judge for the District of Delaware in Wilmington, ap-
pointed on April 6, 2021. Previously, she was member of Cole Schotz P.C.’s Bankruptcy and Cor-
porate Restructuring Department in its Wilmington, Del., office and practiced in the areas of corpo-
rate bankruptcy, insolvency and creditors’ rights, having represented debtors, official committees, 
creditors, examiners and trustees in chapter 11 cases. Judge Stickles has been named in Chambers 
USA: America’s Leading Lawyers for Business since 2010 and has been listed in The Best Lawyers 
in America and in Delaware Super Lawyers in the area of Bankruptcy and Creditor-Debtor Rights 
Law. She served as counsel to chapter 11 debtors in a variety of industries, including manufacturing 
and distribution, telecommunications, health care and media, in some of Delaware’s most significant 
bankruptcy cases. Judge Stickles has published in, and served as a contributing editor for, the ABI 
Journal and has also published in The Americas Restructuring and Insolvency Guide, the ABI Bank-
ruptcy Litigation Committee eNewsletter and the ABI Commercial Fraud Committee eNewsletter. 
Judge Stickles is active in the Bankruptcy Section of the Delaware State Bar Association, having 
served as the Section’s chair (2010-11), vice chair Commercial Bankruptcy (2009-10) and secretary 
(2008-09). She is also a member of the Delaware Views from the Bench Advisory Board and the 
International Women’s Insolvency & Restructuring Confederation (IWIRC), for which she served as 
director-at-large from 2010-11. Judge Stickles received her B.A. in political science and communica-
tions from Western Maryland College and her J.D. from Temple University School of Law.

Charles J. Sullivan is a member of Bond, Schoeneck & King, PLLC in Syracuse, N.Y., and co-chairs 
the firm’s business restructuring, creditors’ rights and bankruptcy practice. He has more than 30 years 
of experience as a financial restructuring and bankruptcy attorney. Mr. Sullivan represents debtors, 
lenders, official committees, asset-purchasers, landlords and trustees in bankruptcy proceedings, fi-
nancial reorganizations, workouts and commercial litigation. He also is an experienced business and 
transactional lawyer. Mr. Sullivan is a frequent speaker on a variety of business and bankruptcy law 
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topics. He is a member New York State, Onondaga County and Central New York Bankruptcy Bar 
Associations, an associate member of the Northeast Cooperative Council, a member of the executive 
board’s Tax and Accounting Committe of the National Council of Farmer Cooperatives, and a statu-
tory draftsperson of the Colorado Cooperatives Act and Amendments to the New York Abandoned 
Property Law. Mr. Sullivan is listed in The Best Lawyers in America for Bankruptcy and Creditor/
Debtor Rights/Insolvency and Reorganization Law, Corporate Law and Litigation - Bankruptcy from  
2010-23, as “Lawyer of the Year” in Syracuse Corporate Law in 2017, 2019, 2021 and 2023, and in 
New York Super Lawyers for Business and Corporate in 2022. He received his B.A. cum laude in 1989 
from St. Lawrence University and his J.D. magna cum laude in 1992 from the University at Buffalo 
School of Law, where he served as head Note and Comment editor for the Buffalo Law Review




